RESULTS OF THE JUNE 03, 2016 PUBLIC AUCTICN

’ SALE STATUS
PIN/APN | LAST ASSESSED OWNER PROPERTY ADDRESS SALE PRICE EXCESS PROCEEDS
01833105 VENTURE OiL COMPANY 850 W BEACH ST NO BID
01833106 VENTURE OIL COMPANY 950 W BEACH ST NO BID
02293119 GRAHAM LINDA ETAL 700 MT HERMON RD NO 8ID
04020123 MANGRUM CREOLA $12,050.00 - $10,814.65
04107114 | MIQUEO FRANCISCC & SANDRA 100 APTOS SCHOOL RD £8,025 00 80.00
04215121 MC INNIS RICH U/M FORFEIT
042158122 MC INNIS AICH UM JT ETAL 105 ESPLANADE FOREFEIT
04415132 CLARK BOREL PATTON $10,400.00 $7,923.43
06701157 WILSON WILLIAM $61.988.00 $57,587 85
07405109 | KAFKA KAREN L GETTY AS TC $6,725.00 $4,382.34
07608102 SCHERMER ROBERT J $5.250 00 $3,608 87
07504348 CAL ONE GO $1,875.00 $0.00
07511207 S0 LEONARD $8,600.00 $5,708 94
07515208 KEENAN LEQ A AND VELMAH $8,250.00 $6,495.83
07517202 P DOMINIC MM SS $3.100.00 $583.38
07525110 COWELL RICHARD SR U/M $2,000.00 $512.81
07605406 MKH VERACRUZ ESTATE NO BID
076068103 | HILL CHARLES D & CHERRIE S JT $5,050.00 $3,423.30
07807707 ARGENEAUT ANALIDA $8,050.00 $3,389.71
07610101 OPEN ARMS GHURGH $5,025.00 $3,020.63
07810801 OPEN ARMS CHURCH $7,725.00 $0.00
07611308 CAL ONE CO $1,125.00 $0.00
07612102 VALTEY VENTURES §79,100.00 £72 501 44
07619214 | WILKINSON MICHAEL V S/M TG NO BID '
07821308 KHANEGHAHT AL) REZA & NO BID
07823312 BARELA ERNEST R $5,250.00 $3,637.55
07826306 | CONGLLEY EDWARD S & JACKI L $5.050 00 $3,807 67
07913216 WILLIAMS ADA $3,250.00 $1,869.59
07913104 | LYMAN BOBIN & DEBRA HMW JT 11530 ALTA VIA $4,105.00 $1,856.00
08212216 MOLINARI POLLY M/W S/S $1,800.00 $542.89
08215520 | MOWLES NAREN SHANTA TC $2,550.00 $796 97
08217602 | ROWAN DONALD F & CARMEN $528.00 $0.00
08228301 LANDMON FRANCES £ $8,700 00 $7,010.05
08226302 LANDMON FRANCES E $8,350.00 $6,660.05
08415102 MC ABEE MARY ANGELA $12,050.00 $10,827 77]
08417116 LEITRIZ PAULA U/W ETAL $2,395,00 $986.53
08504192 | SCHWARTZ ROBERT K ETAL JT §1,800.00 $614 66
08504304 | VINCENT JASON J & REBECCA N $2,200.00 $612.19
08520107 SIMONS CALVIN L 7,025 0D $4,456.96
08616114 WAKEFIELD RUSSELL | & 216 EVEREST DR $42,101.00 $29,792.17
08636107 |SRIDHAR SRINIVASAN & LATA /W __$5,050.00 $8,772.51
08710216 VALLERUTEN HENRY 185 LAUREL DR $18,100.00 $4,728.88
08710217 VALLDERUTEN HENRY 177 LAUREL DR $25.800.00 $11,441 52
08903171 MULLER JOHN & JULIA $35,100.00 $30,635.43
08910184 | ERICSSON ROBERT & DIANNE NC BID '
08940126 LA FORGE RENE U/M $40,252.00 - $5,914.15
09319126 KiM GHRISTY M/W S8 $21,800.00 $7,26222
09330202 | BANNIZA LAWRENCE M/M S5 $27,875.00 $21,196.71
09524101 O FLAHERTY EDWARD J JR $15,725.00 $14,244 43
09708106 QIAO JAMES M/M ETAL $17,200.00 $10,040.87
09821108 MILLEN BRIAN $42,750.00 $2,956.81
10508138 | YANTIS JOHN & JANET H/W CP $8,613.00 $2,999.17
10508143 | YANTIS JOHN & JANET HAW CF $8,800.00 $3,186 17
10607103 MGGANN SCOTT WESTLEY 1251 EUREKA CANYON RD FORFEIT
10642101 | ARTISTS FOR POSITIVE AGTION $55,100.00 $36,580.71
10642102 | FARMER JEAN TRUSTEE ETAL $51,988.00 $43,003.78
10708110 | KERCHNER AARON JAMES M/M $9,000.00 55,286 07
10822116 PRODES STEPHEN U/M 1049 AMEST! RD $59,300.00 $460.41




