
RESULTS OF THE MARCH 29, 2011 PUBLIC AUCTION

APN LAST ASSESSED OWNER PROPERTY ADDRESS CITY MINIMUMBID SALE STATUS 
 EXCESS 

PROCEEDS 
005-148-03 MARK II 517 CEDAR ST SANTA CRUZ 49,000.00$         REDEEMED
009-233-08 GILLESPIE BONNIE & IRENE 138 DAKE AVE SANTA CRUZ 34,000.00$         REDEEMED
011-071-12 THOMAS GARRETT A TRUSTEE ETAL 424 EFFEY ST SANTA CRUZ 12,500.00$         REDEEMED
015-083-15 REGALADO ELEAZAR & ROSALINDA H/W J 86 MEADOW TER WATSONVILLE 11,000.00$         REDEEMED
019-043-02 SOLIS JORGE & MARIA R H/W JT 1106 FREEDOM BLVD WATSONVILLE 34,000.00$         REDEEMED
028-041-52 ENRIQUEZ JUAN & PATTY L H/W JT 834 17TH AVE SANTA CRUZ 24,500.00$         REDEEMED
038-311-18 FRYE EDWARD M III 293 SILVERFISH CT APTOS 44,200.00$         REDEEMED
040-191-03 LUBECK TIM NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $12,700 $11,459.63
041-091-09 ROBISON MARIANNE NONE DESIGNATED 2,200.00$           REDEEMED
042-222-29 GEMANIS GEORGE AND MARGARET NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $1,600 $419.86
044-261-24 HARRIMAN MARTIN V 504 CUESTA DR APTOS 52,000.00$         REDEEMED
045-181-10 ABED WALID H S/S 1535 SAN ANDREAS RD WATSONVILLE 19,000.00$         REDEEMED
051-081-24 ROSAS JUAN J & TERESA L H/W JT 112 MEIDL AVE WATSONVILLE 22,500.00$         REDEEMED
054-151-01 WELLS DAWN MARIE M/W SS 1659 CALYPSO DR APTOS 57,800.00$         REDEEMED
064-152-01 EPSTEIN SAMUEL L M/M S/S 610 LAKEVIEW DR FELTON 65,000.00$         NO BID
068-111-23 HUELIN TERRI F WHITE NONE DESIGNATED 4,000.00$           REDEEMED
068-111-26 HUELIN TERRI F WHITE NONE DESIGNATED 4,000.00$           REDEEMED
068-111-33 HUELIN TERRI F WHITE NONE DESIGNATED 4,000.00$           REDEEMED
068-111-34 HUELIN TERRI F WHITE NONE DESIGNATED 4,000.00$           REDEEMED
071-192-03 BLACK CECILIA M U/W 6656 HWY 9 FELTON 44,000.00$         REDEEMED
074-072-13 HARRIS BETTY J NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           NO BID
075-062-06 BAIRD FRED W NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           SOLD $2,601 $1,177.93
075-082-07 HUELIN MELISSA NONE DESIGNATED 3,800.00$           REDEEMED
075-082-09 HUELIN MELISSA NONE DESIGNATED 5,500.00$           REDEEMED
075-193-38 CROWDER CHARLES A & SUUN H H/W JT NONE DESIGNATED 1,300.00$           SOLD $2,620 $1,756.68
076-014-04 WILLIAMS JUNE MARIE TRUSTEE ETAL NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           REDEEMED
076-055-01 BURT LISA NONE DESIGNATED 2,200.00$           SOLD $6,003 $4,073.84
076-061-06 ROBISON MARIANNE NONE DESIGNATED 2,200.00$           NO BID
077-103-08 PARADIS NAOMA TRUSTEE NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           REDEEMED
078-221-02 ALONSO GEORGE JR S/T NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $1,500 $377.85
079-121-04 MEADOWS GARY G & JENNIFER A H/W JT 366 OLD RIVER LN BROOKDALE 32,000.00$         REDEEMED
079-411-01 GAITHER CARL M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $8,101 $6,919.90
081-043-04 CODDINGTON ANDREA LYNN U/W NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           NO BID
081-253-18 BULLARD ROSS PHARO JR & SUSAN PATR 12564 HWY 9 BOULDER CREEK 4,124.42$                 REDEEMED
082-171-14 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-171-16 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-171-17 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-172-03 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-173-01 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-175-21 CRAMER AILEEN M TRUSTEE NONE DESIGNATED 1,300.00$           NO BID
082-183-09 BEVERNICK ALEXANDER H U/M NONE DESIGNATED 2,500.00$           REDEEMED
082-272-24 CRUTE DOUGLAS W JR NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $1,500 $385.56
083-072-02 LUPER OLIN D U/M NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           NO BID
083-222-13 RYAN LAWRENCE JR S/M NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           SOLD $2,600 $1,169.43
084-073-04 LITTON LOAN SERVICING LP 130 BUENA VISTA AVE BOULDER CREEK 57,000.00$         REDEEMED
085-041-19 PETERSON ERIC J ETAL JT NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           SOLD $2,300 $963.17
085-322-11 MORRIS MICHAEL J ETAL NONE DESIGNATED 1,500.00$           SOLD $2,521.00 $1,501.09
086-101-16 BRANSON AARON & SHERRY H/W JT 420 BRANSON RANCH RD BOULDER CREEK 34,000.00$         REDEEMED
086-531-04 PETERSEN AUBREY S/M NONE DESIGNATED 8,000.00$           REDEEMED
087-093-09 COSTANZO VICTOR C & FRANCES H/W ET NONE DESIGNATED 3,000.00$           NO BID
087-102-31 MC GREGOR DONALD E U/M ETAL 365 REDWOOD DR BOULDER CREEK 19,000.00$         REDEEMED
089-011-03 PARNELLO MICHAEL D S/M ETAL NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           REDEEMED
089-322-09 ELDRIDGE LESTER DONALD & ELIZABETH 17390 BEAR CREEK RD BOULDER CREEK 12,300.00$         REDEEMED
091-012-69 HARRINGTON JAMES H  NONE DESIGNATED 3,200.00$           SOLD $8,700 $5,743.33
091-021-38 BLYTH EDWARD LEE ETAL NONE DESIGNATED 6,000.00$           SOLD $32,100 $26,477.55
092-164-03 REIMANN CECILIA NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           SOLD $1,800 $449.96
092-171-06 ASTORGA ROBERTO NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           NO BID
092-266-10 SMITH WILLIAM Q NONE DESIGNATED 3,000.00$           NO BID
092-268-11 RELICK BURTON  NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           NO BID
092-281-11 SERAFINI HELEN J TRUSTEE NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           REDEEMED
093-321-09 LONG CHARLES J & DONNA L NONE DESIGNATED 4,000.00$           REDEEMED
096-101-04 JOHN CHRISTOPHER U/M JT ETAL NONE DESIGNATED 11,000.00$         REDEEMED
096-171-24 R E ALDERSON & SONS INC NONE DESIGNATED 1,800.00$           NO BID
105-091-10 KLJAJIC MILO MIKE NONE DESIGNATED 2,400.00$           SOLD $2,800 $816.05
105-102-07 R E I M INC NONE DESIGNATED 2,000.00$           SOLD $2,000 $291.89
106-341-11 HAMLIN MARK S U/M 2075 SUMMIT RD WATSONVILLE 31,500.00$         PULLED
107-021-19 GOLDSMITH MICHAEL M U/M NONE DESIGNATED 10,200.00$         REDEEMED
107-092-46 ROGGE LADONNA SUE U/W NONE DESIGNATED 3,800.00$           REDEEMED
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